Pt

O 0 NN N AW

10

12
13
14

21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

BILL NO. 2011-12
ORDINANCE NO®6141

AN ORDINANCE TO ADOPT THE 2009 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE,
TOGETHER WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO, AND TO PROVIDE FOR OTHER RELATED
MATTERS.

Sponsored by: Councilman Steven D. Ross Summary: Adopts the 2009 Edition of the
Uniform Plumbing Code, together with
%m(elndments thereto, as the City’s Plumbing

ode.

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS DOES HEREBY ORDAIN

-AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1: Title 16, Chapter 28, Section 10, of the Municipal Code of the City of

11 " Las Vegas, Nevada, 1983 Edition, is hereby amended to read as follows:

16.28.010:  Those certain documents, [three] copies of each being on file in the Office of the City
Clerk, and designated as follows, are adopted by reference and made a part of this Code, to the same
effect as if set out herein in full:

(A)  Uniform Plumbing Code, [2006] 2009 Edition, including its Standards and

Appendices, except as otherwise indicated, designated as Part 1 of this Chapter; and

(B) A document entitled [“Southern Nevada Amendments to the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code,”] “Southern Nevada Amendments to the 2009 Uniform Plumbing Code,” adding to,
deleting from and amending the Uniform Plumbing Code, [2006] 2009 Edition, designated as Pan 2
of this Chapter. |
SECTION 2: The document entitled Southern Nevada Amendments to the 2009
Uniform Plumbing Code is attached hereto.
SECTION 3: Thedocument entitled “Southern Nevada Amendments to the Uniform
Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition,” is amended by adding thereto the following language:
Section 313.4 of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, is amended by adding thereto a
new sentence, reading as follows:
All copper piping under the slab must be sleeved.
SECTION 4: The Uniform Plumbing Code, 2006 Edition, and the 2006 Southern




— e et e e
H W NN = O

Nevada Plumbing Code Amendments, as amended, are hereby repealed ir.t their entirety.

SECTION 5: This Ordinance shall beéome effectiveon July 5, 2011.

SECTION 6: If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or
phrase in this ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be unconstitutional or invalid or
ineffective by any court of competent jur-isdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity or

effectiveness of the remaining portions of this ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council of the
City of Las Vegas hereby declares that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections,
subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared unconstitutional,
invalid or ineffective.
SECTION 7: Whenever inthis ordinance any act is prohibited or is made or declared
to be unlawful or an offense or a misdemeanor, or whenever in this ordinance the doing of any act is
required or the failure to do any act is made or declared to be unlawful or an offense or a

misdemeanor, the doing of such prohibited act or the failure to do any such required act shall

NN N RN NN NN N = e e
® N LA W N = O OV ® N W

constitute a misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof, shall be punished by a fine of not more than

$1,000.00 or by imprisonment for a term of not more than six months, or by any combination of such

fine and imprisonment. Any day of any violation of this ordinance shall constitute a separate offense.

SECTION 8: All ordinances or parts of ordinances or sections, subsections, phrases,

sentences, clauses or paragraphs contained in the Municipal Code of the City of Las Vegas, Nevada,

1983 Edition, in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. 7 y . |
PASSED, ADOPTED and APPROVED this é_ day of /// 4S ,2011.

APPROVED: "

o D By
- > OSCAR B. GOODMAN, Mayor

City Clerk V

it

APPROVED AS TO OAR*M:\
/@(J%WF 2141y

Date




o

The above and foregoing ordinance was first proposed and read by title to the City Council

[ N N N N N N — ey U — — o ot ot — b
N (V] BN w [\ — (] O (=] ~ S, W S w N —t (]

on the 2™ day of March, 2011, and referred to a committee for recommendation; thereafter

‘the corhmitt,ee reported favorably on said ordinance on the 6" day of April, 2011, which as

a regular meeting of said Council; that at said regular meeting, the proposed ordinance

was read by title to the City Council aS first i_ntroduced and adopted by the following vote:

VOTING "AYE"™: Mayor Goodman and Councilmemﬁers Reese, Tarkanian, Ross,
Barlow and Anthony ‘

VOTING "NAY":  None

EXCUSED:  None V

ABSTAINED: | None

DID NOT VOTE:  Councilmember Wolfson

APPROVED:

OSCARB. GO%DMANE, Mayor




Southem Nevada Bulldmg
| Officials
o/o City of Las Vegas
' Bm]dmg & Safety Dept
713 S. 4™ Street
| Las Viegas, NV 89101

Phone: 702-229-6257
Fax: 702-382-1731

| Email:

chknight(@ evada; )
| MEMBERS. -

Chris Knight, Chair
1 City of Las Vegas

" | Greg Blackburn

City of North Las Vegas
Roﬁ Nybo
| City of Boulder City

Ron Lynin .
- Clark County . °

' Kurt Sawyer
City of Mesquite

Brent Steed .
Pahrump Regional
Planning District

- (Nye County) .

Michael Bouse .
City of Hendefson

Lisa Conner -
Clark County School District

SOUTHERN-NEVADA AMENDMENTS

TO THE
2009

' UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

Approved by SNBO
July 23, 2010



Chapter 1 Admlmstration

Delete Chapter: 1 wzth the exceptzon of Sections 101.1, 1 01.2 and 103. 1 3 and revise Section 1 03 1.3, as
follows: ’ .

103.1.3 Plumbmg Licensing Provision.  Provision for hcensmg shall be determmed by the
Administration Provnsmn of Authonty Havmg Junsdlctlon . :

Section 205 Definitions. |
_Add a new deﬁrgilion to Section 205 to be placed in alphabetical order, as follows:

Combustible Construction - Combustible construction shall mean work within any buﬂdmg or structure
classifiedas Type 111, Type IV or Type V ‘as defined in the Bunldmg Code. Plastic piping is not penmtted
in Type I and Type Il bulldmgs

Section 311.4 Pro'hibited_Fittin_gs.and Practices. _
Revise Section 311.4 by. deieting the second sentence and adding a new exception as folIOWS'

3114 Except as hereinafter provided in Sections 908.0, 909.0 and 910.0, no vent pipe shall be used asa
soxl or waste plpe nior shall any soil or waste pipe be used as a vent.

Exception: Smgle stick DWV systems may be used provxded they are designed by a Nevada
registered Mechanical Engineer and approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

Section 402.2 Water Closets.
Rev:se Sectum 402.2 in its entirety, as follows:

402.2 Water Closets. Water closets, either flush tank, flushometer tank or ﬂushometer valve operated,
shall have an average consumption of 1.6.gallons (6.1 liters) of water per flush. A timing device or other
‘mechanism which will automatically flush a water closet periodically or continually is prohibited.

Seclion 402.3 Urinals.
Revzse Section’ 402.3 in its entirety, as follows:

402.3 Urinals. Urinals shall have an average water consumption of 1 gallon (3.8 liters) of water per- ﬂush
A timing device or other mechanism which will automatically flush a urinal perlodxcally or continually is
prohibited.

Sectioh 411.2 Location of Floor Drains.

Add a new Section, 411 .2.4, as follows:

411.2.4 All Fire Pump rooms shall be provided with a (3) inch (76 mm) minimum floor drain which must
be connected to-an approved trap primer.

Section 412.1 Minimum Number of required Fixtures.

Delete Sections 412.2 through 412.6 and Table 4-1 in their entirety and revise Section 412.1, as follows: ‘

412,1 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures. Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of
occupancy and in the minimum number as required by the currently adopted Building Code.

Page 1



Section 413.1 leitatlon of Hot Water Temperature for Public Lavatories
Add a new Exceptton to Sectton 41 3 1, as follows:

413.1 Limitatlon of Hot Water Temperature for Puhlic Lavatories Hot water delivered from public:
use lavatories shall be limited to a maximum temperature of 120°F (49°C) by a device that conforms to
ASSE 1070-or CSA BlZS 3. The water heater thermostat shall not be consxdered a control for meeting
this prowsron : : ‘

Exception: An ASSE 1017 listed device may be acceptable when the maximum' temperature settmg -
for the device is 120°F. ,

Sectlon 414 5 The leitatlon of I-Iot Water in Bathtubs and Whirlpool Bathtubs
Add a new Exception to Sectton 41 4.5, as follows:

414.5 The Limitation of Hot Water in Bathtubs and _Whirlpool Bathtubs. The maximum hot water

temperature discharging from the bathtub and whirlpool bathtub filler shall be limited to 120°F (49°C) by
" a device that conforms to ASSE 1070 or -CSA B125.3. The water heater thermostat shall not be
. considered a control for meetmg this provision. ‘

Exception An.ASSE 1017 listed device may be acceptable when the maximum temperature settmg
for the device is 120°F. .

Section 416.3 Limitatiou of Water 'l‘emperature in Bidets.
Add-a new Exceptton to Section 416.3, as follows:

416.3 leltatlon of Water Temperature in Bidets. The maximum  hot water temperature discharging
* from a bidet shall be limited to 110°F (43°C) by a device that conforms to ASSE 1070 or CSA B125.3.
The water heater thermostat shall not be considered a control for meeting this provision.

Exception: An ASSE 1017‘_listed device may be acceptable when the maximum temperature setting
for the device is 120°F. In no case shall the setting for the bidet exceed 110°F. : '

Section 509.3.1 Acceas to Appliances on Roofst
Revise Section 509.3.1; as follows:

509.3.1 Gas utilization appliances located on roofs or other elevated locations shall be accessible: by
permanent roof access ladders, as follows:

1) Each ladder shall have side railings which extend at least thirty (30) inches (762 mm)
above the roof or parapet wall.

) Each ladder shall be a minimum of fourteen (14) inches (356 mm) in width.
?3) Each ladder rung shall be spaced at a maximum of fourteen (14) inches (356 mm) on center.
@ Each ladder shall have a minimumn of a six (6) inch (152 mm) toe space. '

) Each ladder shall have intermediate horizontal landings whenever the ladder height exceeds
eighteen feet (5486 mm) above finished grade. Landings shall be placed at eighteen foot
(5486 mm) intervals, maximum,

Exceptions:

1. Permanent exterior ladders providing roof access need not extend closer than eight (8) feet
(2438 mm) to the finish grade.

2. A portable ladder may be used for access for Group R Division 3 and 4 and U occupancies.

Page 2



3 Permanent ladders for equlpment access. need not be prov1ded at parapets or walls less than'
thlrty (30) inches (762mm) in helght

" Section 510 6 Gas vents.
Add a new Exception to Section 510 6 2, item #1, as follows:
510.6.2 A gas vent shall terminate in accordance with one. of the following:

(1) Above the roof surface with alisted cap- or listed roof assembly. Gas: vents twelve (12) inches (300
mm).in size or smaller with listed caps shall be: permitted to. be:terminated in accordance with Figure
5-2, provided they are at least eight (8) feet (2.4 m) from a vertical wall or similar obstruction. Other
gas vents shall terminate-not less than two (2) feet (0.6 m) above the highest point where they pass
through the roof and at least two (2) feet (0.6 m) exceedmg any. portion of a bulldmg within ten (10)
feet (3.1 m).

Exceptlon:, A single';familyf residence having. .gas vents twelve (12) 'inches ‘(300 mm) in size or
smaller with listed caps shall be permitted to. be terminated in ‘accordance with Figure 5-2, provided
they are at least four (4), feet (1.2 m) from a vertical wall or similar obstruction. '

Items (2)..thra,u§h ‘(G)iremain unchanged;

Section 603.3 General Requirements. '
Revise Section 603.3.3, as follows:

603.3.3 The premise owner or responsible person shall have the backflow. prevention assembly tested by a
certified backflow assembly tester at the time of installation, repair, or relocation and not less than on an
annual schedule thereafter, or more often when required by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. The
certified tester- shall leave a copy of their backflow certification on site along with a copy of the
certification of each device tested: These documents shall be recorded into the permanent record at the
time of installation. The periodic testing shall be performed in accordance with the procedures referenced

in Table 14-1 by a tester qualified in accordance with those standards. '

Section 603.4.12 Potable Water Supply to Carbonators.
Rev:se Section 603.4.12, as follows ‘

603.4.12 Potable Water Supply to Carbonators. Potable water supply to carbonators shall be protected
'by a listed reduced pressure principle backflow preventer as approved by the authonty having
jurisdiction.

Section 604.0 Materials.
Add a new Section 604.1.1, as follows:
604.1.1 Plastic piping shall be limited to buildings defined as combustible construction by this code.

Section 608.5 Relief Valves.
Revise Section 608.5 Relief Valves, as follows:

608.5 Relief Valves. Relief valves located inside a building shall be provided with a drain, not smaller
than the relief valve outlet, of galvanized steel, hard- drawn copper piping and fittings, CPVC, flexible
corrugated connectors complying with 604.12, or listed relief valve drain tube with fittings that will not
reduce the internal bore of the pipe or tubing (straight lengths as opposed to coils) and shall extend from
the valve to the outside of the building with the end of the pipe not more than two (2) feet (610 mm) nor

Page 3



less than six (6) inches (152 mm) above the. ground or the flood level of the- area receiving the discharge
and pointing downward. Temperature and Pressure Relief (T & P) drains shall discharge to the exterior
of the building unless structural conditions or the manufacturers listing prevent this termination. T-& P
“drains may discharge through an air gap into a secondary clothes washer port, orthrough an air gap ina
floor sink or a floor drain provided they are located in normally unoccupied areas. No-part of such drain
pipe shall be trapped or subject to freezing. The terminal end of the drain pipe shall not be threaded.

' Section 701 0 Materials v
Revise Sectzon 701.0 by addmg a new Section 701.1.2.1 Materzals as foIIows

!

. 701.1.2.1 ‘Materials. Plastlc plpmg used for drainage waste and vent systems shall ‘be limited to
bulldmgs deﬁned as-combustible construction by this code A

Section 704.3 leture Connectlons (Dramage)
- Revise Section 704. 3 as follows:

704.3 Pot sinks, scullery sinks, dlshwashmg sinks, silverware sinks, commercial d1shwash1ng machines
and other similar fixtures shall be indirectly connected to the drainage systems by means of an air gap. -

Section 707.10 Cleanouts
Adda new Exception to Section 707.1 0, as foIIows
707.10 Cleanout fittings shall be not less in size than those given in Table 7-6.

- Exception: Where a 2-1/2” (mch) cleanout is required, a 2” (inch) cleanout may be used for horizontal
branch waste lines. '

Section 710.1 Drainage of Fixtures Located Below the Next Upstream Manhole or Below the Main
Sewer level.

Delete Section 710.1, in its entirety and replace, as follows:

710.1 Drainage Piping servicing fixtures which have flood level rims located below the elevation of the
next upstream manhole cover of the public or private sewer serving such drainage piping shall be
protected from backflow of sewage by installing an approved type backwater valve; Other than a single
dwelling unit served by an individual sewer, fixtures above such elevation shall not discharge through the
backwater valve.

Section 801.2.2 Food and Beverage Handling Establishments.
Revise Section 801.2.2, as follows:

801.2.2 For walk-in coolers, floor drains shall be permitted to be connected to a separate drainage line
discharging into an outside receptor. The flood level rim of the receptor shall be not less than six (6)
inches (152 mm) lower than the lowest floor drain. Such floor drains shall be trapped and individually
-vented. Cleanouts shall be provided at every nmety (90) degree (1.6 rad) turn and shall be accessibly
located. Such waste shall discharge through an alrgap into a trapped and vented receptor except that full-
size airgap is required where the mdlrect waste pipe may be under vacuum.

Page 4



Section 801.2.4 Floor Sinks. : . N
Revise Sectton 801.2 by addmg a new Section 801 24 Floor Smlrs as ﬁ)IIows : : o

801 2.4 Floor. Slnks Floor smks shall be installed flush. wnth the ﬁmshed floor and shall be accessible for |
cleaning. -

Section 804 1 Indirect Waste Receptors.
Revise Section 804 1by addmg -a new second paragraph, as ﬁ)llows

When any mdlrect waste piping other than the dlscharge from the clothes: washer is terminated into a
* washer box, a double port clothes washer box shall be used. The second port shall be permanently
connected to the vertical receptor standpipe via'a wye branch fitting or a listed multiport clothes: washer
box may be used. The clothes washer shall discharge through an air break into the primary receptor
standpipe. All other mdlrect waste piping shall discharge into the secondaty port through an air gap.

Section 903.0 Materials ' ,
Revise Section 903 1by addmg a new section 903.1.2. I as follows:

903.1.2.1 Plastic piping used for drainage waste and vent systems shall be lmuted to buildings defined as
combustlble construction by this.code.

1009.0 Gravity Grease Interceptors.

Delete Sections 1 009 0 through 1017.2, retain Table 10-3 and add new Sections 1009.0, 1010.0, 1011.0,
1012.0 and 1013.0, asfoIIows 3

- 1009.0 - Gravnty Grease mterceptors

1009.1 General. A grease mterceptor shall be provided for proper handling of liquid wastes containing

- grease. A grease interceptor as described in these standards shall be installed in any business

* establishment with kitchen facilities including restaurants, cafes, lunch counters, cafeterias, supermarkets,

convenience stores, bakeries, bars and clubs, hotels, hospitals, sanitariums, factory or school kitchens, or
any other commercial establnshment where grease may be introduced into the sewer system.

Special consideration shall be given to every fish, fowl and animal slaughterhouse or establishment; every
fish, fowl and meat packing or curing establishment; every soap factory, tallow rendering, fat rendering
and hide curing establishment; or any other establishment from which considerable amounts of grease are
likely to be dlscharged into the sewer system. Written application describing exact operation and
anticipated volumes of grease shall be made to the Sanitation Authority Having Jurisdiction to determine
the standards for such systems.

1009.2 Fixtures. The waste discharge from fixtures and equipment which may contain grease from the
businesses set out previously shall be drained through a grease interceptor or grease interceptors. Fixtures
such as, but not limited to, the following are included: scullery sinks; pot and pan sinks, dishwashing
machines, soup kettles and similar cooking equipment, trash compactors, floor drains in grease generating
areas, and trash can wash areas. "

1009.3 Prohibited fixtures. The waste lines from toilets, urinals, and other similar fixtures shall not
drain through a grease interceptor.

1009.4 Location.

(1)  Grease interceptors shall be so installed and connected that they shall be at all times easily
accessible for inspection, cleaning and removal of the intercepted grease.

(2) Grease interceptors shall be placed as close as practical to the fixtures served.

Page 5



3

Grease mterceptors shall be located ‘on’ the exterlor of bulldmgs unless spec1ﬁcally approved ‘
otherw1se in wrltmg by the health district. ‘

Grease mterceptors shall be so located as to be accesslble for service w1thout the use of ladders or

)
the: removal of bulky. equlpment _ ‘

5 Locatlon of all grease mterceptors shall. be shown on the -approved plans _ '

(6) Each- grease mterceptor shall serve only one business. establishment. ‘Multiple business connectlons
toa smgle interceptor are not penmtted Unless approved by the sanitation authority i m writing,

(7) An access1ble hose bib shall be located within 25 feet (7620 mm) of every grease lnterceptor

1009 5 Size. N : o

(1) Grease mterceptors shall be sized in accordance with Table 10—3 Interceptors shall not be more "
than one: size larger than required in Table 10—3 K .

NOTE: For sltuatlons not covered by Table 10-3, a submittal showmg the mterceptor size
and calculations shall be approved by the sanitation authority prior to building official plan
approval. For business establishments other than commercial restaurants, a specific- submital
shall be approved by the. sanitation authority prior to building official plan approval. Such
deslgns shall be prepared by a'Nevada Registered Engineer. o
(2)  All grease interceptors shall have a minimum of two compartments with a minimum of 3 mch (76.2
"mm) diameter fittings deslgned for grease retention. - The fittings shall be installed in the following
manner: -A sanitary tee shall be installed at the inlet, a sanitary tee on the inlet side of the
mterceptor baffle, and a sanitary tee. mstalled at the outlet.

(3) There shall be adequate access for cleaning all areas of the separator. A minimum of one access
point into each compartment within the separator shall be provided. In addition, no access points
shall be further apart than 10 feet (3048 mm) regardless of the number of compartments. Separator
covers_shall be of gas-tight -construction. Interceptor covers shall have a minimum opening
-dimension of twenty (20) inches (508 mm) in diameter. -

(4)  All waste shall enter the grease interceptor through the inlet pipe.

5) Grease interceptors shall be so designed that they will not become air bound. Each interceptor shall
be prope'rly vented with a relief vent located on the outlet side of the interceptor.

(6) Cleanouts shall be installed in the drainage plpmg inlet and outlet side of each grease interceptor
and the outlet side of each sample box. :

(7). Each fixture discharging into a grease interceptor shall be individually trapped and vented in an
approved manner.

(8) Each grease mterceptor shall have an approved water seal of not less than two (2) inches (50.8 mm)
in depth or the diameter of its outlet whichever is greater.

(9) When grease interceptors are located in areas of pedestrian or vehicle travel, the design of the
interceptor shall be adequate to support the imposed load. Structural calculations to venfy its
adequacy may be required.

(10) A sample box shall be provided on the outlet side of each grease interceptor down stream of the

required cleanout and vent.

1009.6 Water Test. A water test shall be applied to the level of the top of the interceptor mlet opening
through the outlet opening or discharge side of the sample box. Interceptors shall show no leakage from
section seams, pinholes or other imperfections. Any leakage below this level is cause for rejection.

)

Backfill. Interceptors shall not be backfilled until the inspection-has been made to verify there are
no leaks.

Page 6



1010.0 Sand/Oil lnterceptors

1010 1 Where Required. ‘An 1nterceptor shall be prov1ded for the proper handllng of llquld wastes-
contammg oil (of petroleum origin), sand, inert solids or any other similar substances.

NOTE: A sand/oil interceptor is not intended for the dlsposal of hazardous waste or as a backupv
system for accidental: spllls

Interceptors as described in these standards shall ‘be installed in, but not limited to, the following .

_ locations: car’ washes, _motor vehicle, ‘boat or airplane storage yards, gasoline and diesel service
- stations, repair- garages or any other s1mllar faclllty whlch may introduce sanid and oil into the sewer

system.

Submittal of a written. appllcatlon describing the exact facility operatlon and the types- and antlclpated'.
volumes of waste to be generated may be required by the building official. »

“1010.2 Fixtures. The waste discharge from fixtures and eqmpment which may contaln sand oil-based
wastes and inert solids shall drain only through an interceptor. This requirement includes, but. is not
limited to, the followmg floor drams, floor sinks, special processing equipment, trench drains, and area

drains.

1010.3 Prohiblted letures The waste line from toilets, urinals, lavatones and other smnlar fixtures,
‘which discharge domestlc wastes only, shall not drain through the interceptor.

1010.4 Location.

M

Sand/ oil interceptors shall be so installed and connected that they shall be at all times accessible
for inspection, cleaning and removal of the intercepted waste.

(2) Sand/oil interceptors‘ shall be plaeed as close as practical to the fixtures served.

(3) Sand/ oil interceptors shall be located on the exterior of buildings unless specifically approved
otherwise in writing by the sanitation authority.

4) Sand/ oil mterceptors shall be located as to be accessnble for service without the use of ladders or
the removal of bulky equipment.

(5) Location of all sand/oil interceptors shall be shown on the approved plans.

(6) Each sand/ oil interceptor shall serve only one busmess establlshment Multiple business
connections to a single sand/ oil interceptor are not penmtted unless approved by the sanitation
authority in wntmg

1010.5 Size and Design.

(1)  All sand/oil interceptors shall be a minimum of three hundred (300) gallons (40 cubic feet) (1136 1)
of total liquid capacity with a minimum floating liquid capacity of 55 gallons (208 1).

(2)  All sand/oil interceptors shall have a minimum of two compartments with a minimum of 3 inch
(76.2 mm) diameter fittings designed for retention. The fittings shall be installed in the following
manner: a 90° long sweep shall be installed at the interceptor inlet, a sanitary tee shall be installed
on the inlet side of the interceptor baffle, and a sanitary tee installed at the outlet.

(3) There shall be adequate access for cleaning all areas of the separator.v’ A minimum of one (1)
access point into each compartment within the separator shall be provided. In addition, no access
points shall be further apart than ten (10) feet (3048 mm) regardless of number of compartments.
Access covers shall have a minimum opening dimension of twenty (20) inches (508 mm) in
diameter. Separator covers shall be of gas-tight construction.

(4) The sand/oil interceptor shall be properly vented and designed to prevent it from becoming air

bound in accordance with this code.

Page 7



(5) Each business estabhshment for wh1ch a sand/oil mterceptor is required- shall be. prov1ded w1th an
. interceptor ‘which shall serve that establlshment only and no others.. ‘Separate owners- or lessees -
" within a large business or establishment shall require:separate mterceptors

(6)° Each sand/oil [interceptor shall have a water seal of not less than six (6)- inches: (152 mm).

D - When separators are located in areas of foot or vehicle traffic, the design .of the separator shall be
- adequate for the imposed load. Structural calculations performed bya Nevada Registered Engmeer
_to venfy adequacy may be requmed '

® Any private or public wash rack. or slab usedfor: cleamng machmery or machme parts shall drain
- toa sand/oil separator, and shall be adequately protected against storm or surface water intrusion. -

) Des1gn standards other than those: listed above may be acceptablc Redwood baffles shall not be
used for new or existing interceptors. Any alternate design shall -be prepared by a Nevada.
* Registered Engineer and submitted for review and approval by the sanitation authority and the .
bulldmg official.

(10) ‘Cleanouts shall be mstalled in the dramage piping inlet and outlet 31de of each sand/oﬂ mterceptor
‘and the: outlet s1de of each sample box. : o A

(1) A sample ‘box shall be prov1ded on. the outlet s1de of the mterceptor down stream. of the required
cleanout and vent. :

1010.6 Water Test. A water test shall be apphed to the level of the top of the mterceptor inlet opening
through the outlet opening or discharge side of the sample box. Interceptors shall show no leakage from
section seams, pmholes or other imperfections. Any leakage below this level is cause for rejectlon

(1) Backfill: Interceptors shall not be backfilled untll the mspectlon has been made to venfy there are
no leaks.
1011.0 Maintenance of interceptors.

1011.1 Grease and sand/oil interceptots shall be maintained in efficient operating condition hy periodic
removal of the accumulated grease or sand/oil. No such collected grease, sand/oil, or any material
collected from the mterceptor shall be introduced into any drainage piping, public or private sewers. The

- - materials removed from interceptors shall be handled and disposed of in a proper manner in accordance

with published health district and 'sanitation authonty requxrements Illegal dumping of waste into the
sewer shall not be allowed.

1011.2 Maintenance records for each mstalled interceptor shall be maintained on the premises at all times
and presented to a duly authonzed agent of the sanitation authority upon request.

1011.3 The Authority. Havmg Jurisdiction shall have the authority to mandate the installation of
additional equipment or devices and enforce a maintenance program.

1012.0 Abandoned interceptors. Abandoned interceptors shall be cleaned and filled as required by
Section 722.0 of the Plumbing Code for abandoned sewers and sewage disposal facilities.

1013.0 Existing Buildings. Whenever an existing building has a change in use which requires an
interceptor or whenever there is an increase in the total number of drainage fixture units served by an
existing interceptor, one or more interceptors shall be installed in the drainage system serving the building
meeting the requirements of Section 1009 and 1010.

Section 1101.3 Material Uses.
Revise Section 1101.3 by adding a new Section 1101.3.1, as follows:

1101.3.1 Plastic piping used for rainwater systems shall be limited to buildings defined as combustible
construction by this code.

Page 8



* Section 1101.5.1 Subsoll Drains.
Revise Sectton 1 101.5. 1,as follows:

1101:5.1 Where required by the geotechmcal engmeer or the authonty havmg Junsdlctlon subsoil drains -
shall be provided around the perimeter of buildings having basements, cellars, or crawl spaces or floors

below grade. Such subsoil drains may be positionéd inside or outside of ‘the footing, shall be of

.perforated, or dpen-Jointéd approved drain tile or pipe not less than three (3), inches (80 mm) in diameter,
and shall be laid in gravel, slag, crushed rock, approved three-quarter (3/4) inch (19.1 mm) crushed

recycled glass aggregate or-other approved porous material with a minimum of four (4) inches (102 mm) -
surroundmg the pipe on all sides. Filter media shall be prov1ded for exterior subsoil piping.

Delete Section 1101.9, Fi illing Stations and Motor Vehicle Washing Establishments, in its entirety.
Delete chtion 11 01.10, Paved Areas, in its entirety.

Delete Section 1103.0, Traps'm; Storm drains and Leéders, in its entirety.

Delete Section 1104.3, Combining Storm with Sanitary Drainage, in its entirety.

Section 1203.3 Fuel gas. .
Revise Section 1203.3 by adding a new Section 1 203.3.1, as Jfollows:

1203.3.1 Dry Gas- A gas having a moisture and hydrocarbon dew point below any normal temperature
to which the gas piping is exposed. Southem Nevada shall be cons1dered a dry gas condition area unless
specified by the local gas purveyor.

Section 1211.1.6 Piping Underground Beneath Buildings.
Delete Section 1211.1.6 in its entirety and replace, as follows:

1211.1.6 Piping Underground Beneath Buildings. No gas piping shall be installed in or on the ground
under any bulldmg or structure unless installed in gastight conduit, and all exposed gas piping shall be
kept at least six (6) inches (152 mm) above grade or structure. The term “building or structure” shall
include structures such as porches and steps, whether covered or uncovered, breezeways, roofed porte- -
cocheres, roofed patios, carports, covered walks, covered driveways, and similar structures or
appurtenances. All gas piping under a slab shall be capable of being removed and replaced.

The conduit shall be of material approved for installation underground beneath buildings and not less than
Schedule 40 pipe. The interior diameter of the conduit shall be not less than one-half (1/2) inch (15 mm)
larger than the outside diameter of the gas piping.

The conduit shall extend to a point at least (12) inches (305 mm) beyond any area where it is required to
be installed or to the outside wall of a building, and the outer ends shall not be sealed. Where the conduit
terminates within a building, it shall be readily accessible and the space between the conduit and the gas
piping shall be sealed to prevent leakage of gas into the building.

Exception: Products listed for such use.

Page 9



Section 121‘1.3 2. Conuections.' o
Revise: ttem (4) in Sectton 121 1.3.2, as follows

1211.32 Connections. Where: gas piping is to be concealed umons, tubing ﬁttmgs bushmgs and
compression. couplings made by combmatlons of ﬁttmgs shall not be used Connectlons shall be of the
following types : : : -

(1) - Pipe ﬁttmgs such as. elbows tees, ‘and couplmgs
(2) - Joining tubing by brazmg (see Section 1209. 5. 8. 2)

= 3) Fittings. listed for use in concealed spaces that-have been demonstrated to sustain, without
leakage, any forces. due to temperature expansion or contraction, vxbratlon, or fatlgue based
on their geographic location, applncatlon or operatxon : .

| “@ Where necessary to insert ﬁttmgs in gas pipe that has been installed in a concealed locatlon, /
the pipe shall be reconnected by weldmg, ﬂanges, or with right and left couplings.

Section 1214. 3 Test Pressure
Delete Section 121 4.3.1 inits enttrety and replace; as follows:

1214.3.1 This. mspectlon shall be made after all piping authorized by the permxt has been installed and
after all portions thereof which are to be covered or concealed are so concealed and before any fixtures,
appliance, or shutoff valve has been attached thereto. This inspection shall include an air, CO2 or nitrogen
pressure test, ‘at which time:the gas piping shall stand a pressure of not.less than ten (10) pounds per
square inch (68.9 kPa) gauge pressure, or at the discretion of the Administrative Authority, the piping and
valves may be tested ‘at a pressure of at least six (6) inches (152 mm) of mercury, measured with a
manometer or slope gauge. Test pressures shall be held for a length of time satisfactory to the
Administrative Authonty, but in no case for less than fifteen (15) minutes, with no perceptible drop in
pressure. For welded piping, and for piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches
(356 mm) water column pressure, the test pressure shall not be less than sixty (60) pounds per square inch
(413.4 kPa) and shall be continued for a length of time:satisfactory to the Administrative Authority, but in
no case for less than thn'ty (30): minutes. These tests shall be made using air, CO2, or nitrogen pressure
only and shall be made in the presence of the Administrative Authority. All necessary apparatus for
conducting tests shall be furnished by the permit holder. Test gauges used in conducting tests shall
comply with Section 319.0, Test Gauges. :

Delete Chapter 13, Health Care Facilities and Medical Gas and Vacuum System’s, in its entirety.
Delete Chapter 15, Firestop Protection, in its entirety.

Delete Chapter 16, Part 1 - Gray Water Systems, Sections 1601 through 1612 in their entirety.

Page 10



: Sectlon 1613.0' Reclalmed Water Systems General
Rewse Section 1613.0/(4), as foIlows _ '
, -1613 0Reclaimed Water: Systems ‘General.

(A) The provisions of: Part II of this: chapter shall not be allowed in residential bulldmgs and:shall applyto -
the installation, construction, alteration, and repair of reclaimed water systems intended to supply -uses
such as water closets urinals, trap primers for floor drains, floor sinks, irrigation, industridl processes,
water features ‘and other uses approved by the Authority Havmg Jurisdiction. Potable water supplied as
makeup water: in these. systems shall be protected agamst back-pressure. and back-syphonage in
~accordance with Sections 602:0.and 603.0: , , : L "

Delete Appendi;t F, Fireﬁgh_ter-Breathing Air R_eplenishment-System&, in its éyﬁrggr.~

Delete Appendix K, Private Sewage DisposaI.Systems, inits entirety.

Page 11



BUSINESS IMPACT STATEMENT
BILL NO. 2011-12
(Adopts the 2009 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code, together with amendments
~ thereto, as the City’s Plumbing Code)
This business impact statement was prepared pursuant to NRS 237.090 to address the impact of a

proposed ordinance, Bill No. 2011-12, that will adopt the 2009 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing
Code, together with amendments thereto, as the City’s Plumbing Code.

1. The following constitutes a description of the manner in which comment was solicited
from affected businesses, a summary of their responses and an explanation of the manner
in which other interested persons may obtain a copy of the summary.

Notice of the proposed ordinance was published in the Las Vegas Review-Journal. In addition, a
copy of the notice was provided to development-related and construction groups that are

representative of affected industries. No written responses were received.

2. The estimated economic effect of the proposed rule on businesses, including, without
limitation, both adverse and beneficial effects, and both direct and indirect effects:

Adverse effects:

Those proposing construction will need to plan for and adjust to any new or differing Code
requirements

Beneficial effects:

Code provisions that are updated and that are consistent with other area jurisdictions

Direct effects:

See adverse and beneficial effects above

Indirect effects:

None identified

3. The following constitutes a description of the methods the local government considered
to reduce the impact of the proposed rule on businesses and a statement regarding whether

any, and if so which, of these methods were used:

Not applicable



4. The governing body estimates the annual cost to the local government for enforcement
" of the proposed rule is:

No additional cost

5. If the proposed rule provides for a new fee or increases an existing fee, the total annual
amount:expected to be collected is: '

Not applicable

6. If the proposed rule zprovidesf for a new fee or increases an existing fee, the money
generated by the new fee or increase in existing fee will be used by the local government to:

Not applicable
7. If the proposed rule includes provisions that duplicate or are more stringent that
federal, state or local standards regulating the same activity, the following explains when

such duplicative or more stringent provisions are necessary:

Not applicable

Date: February 16, 2011



‘-

AFFP DISTRICT COURT
Clark County, Nevada

AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

STATE OF NEVADA)
COUNTY OF CLARK) SS:

Stacey M. Lewis, being 1st duly sworn, deposes and says: That she is the Legal

Clerk for the Las Vegas Review-Journal and the Las Vegas Sun, daily newspapers
regularly issued, published and circulated in the City of Las Vegas, County of Clark,
State of Nevada, and that the advertisement, a true copy attached for,

LV CITY CLERK

2296311LV

7069075

was continuously published in said Las Vegas Review-Journal and / or Las Vegas
Sun in 1 edition(s) of said newspaper issued from 03/24/2011 to 03/24/2011, on the

following days:

03/24/2011

— " BILLNO.20112

INANCE TO ADOPT THE 2009
égl'ﬁgg % THE UNIFORM pwm&w&
e D TO

TS THERETQ, AN
ék‘é#%“é‘"m OTHER RELATED
MATTERS.

sponsored by! Councliman Steven
D. ROSS 1on
. Adopts the 2009 Editl
glf.lmm:rymﬁ?o:“ plumbing COec{g.
together.with amendments thereto,
as the City's Plumbing Code.

At the Clty Council meeting of
‘MARC

2011 _
BILL Nrfmzion-u WAS READ BY TITLE
AND _ REFERRED _T0

' MENDING COMMITTEE

A RECOM-

f : PLETE

COPIES  OF - "HE  COMPLETE
ARE AVAILABLE F

Rk ot TG

(S)F1E.{NHER% AVENUE, LAS VEGAS:

NEW“MPUB: March 24, 2011

L Revlew-.loumg .




AFFP DISTRICT COURT
Clark County, Nevada

AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

STATE OF NEVADA)
COUNTY OF CLARK) SS:

Stacey M. Lewis, being 1st dul
Clerk for the Las Vegas Review-
regularly issued, published and
State of Nevada, and that the a

LV CITY CLERK

was continuously published in said Las Vegas Revi
( I0 . eview-
Sun in 1 edition(s) of said newspaper issugd from 04/0

following days:

04/09/2011

|

{

y sworn, deposes and says: That she is the L

: egal
.'Journal and the L;s Vegas Sun, daily newspagpers
C|rcuilated in the City of Las Vegas, County of Clark
dvertisement, a true copy attached for,

2296311LV

AN ORR\'NANUE 70 ADOPT THE 2009
EDITION OF THE UNIFORM PLUMBING
ETHER WITH

. CODE, TOG!

: AMENDMENTS THERETO, AND TO-
| PROVIDE - FOR OTHER' RELATED
- MATTERS., -

' summary: Adopts the 2

; committee + for recommendatiqen(i ‘

" PUBLIC INFORMATION

7). i

Sponsored by: Councliman Steven
D. Ross .

\ Edition
of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
together with amendments thereto,
as the City's Plumblng Code.

The .above and foregolng ordinance
was first proposed and read by title
to the City Councli on the 2nd day of
March 2011 and referred to a

thereafter the committee report

favorably on sald ordinance on the
6th day of Alprll 2011, which was a
regular meeting of sald City Council;
and that at sald regular meeting the

Itle to

following vote:

VOTING "AYE":Mayor Goodman and
Counclimembers Reese, Tarkantan,
Ross, Barlow and Anthony

VOTING "NAY":NONE

. EXCUSEe:NON
' NOT VOVING:Councliman Wolfson

. COPIES OF THE  COMPLETE
ORDINANCE ARE AV,IA':LABLE FOR
E CITY CLERK, 1ST FLODR, 400

OF THI
STEWART - AVENUE, LAS VEGAS,
NEVADA .

PUB: April 9,.2011
LV Review-Journal .

7108457

Journal and / or Las Vegas
9/2011 to 04/09/2011, on the

ol

proposed ordinance was read by
the City co\;acll cas
ntroduced and was adopted by the -

THE OFFICE

Ll

SUB

IBED AND WE ME THIS, THE
day of /4] ‘ f )., 2011

EMILY GONZALEZ

V4 ) Notary Public State of Nevada

"+ No. 09-8940:1
My appt. exp. Nov. 13, 2012

Notary Public l

Q




