10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

24

25

26

BILL NO. 2025-23
ORDINANCE NO. 6916

AN ORDINANCE TO ADOPT THE 2024 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE,
TOGETHER WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO, AND TO PROVIDE FOR OTHER RELATED

MATTERS.
Proposed by: Seth T. Floyd, Director of Summary:  Adopts tﬁe 2024 Edition of the
Community Development Uniform Plumbing Code, together with
amendments thereto.

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1: Title 16, Chapter 28, Section 10, of the Municipal Code of the City of Las
Vegas, Nevada, 1983 Edition, is hereby amended to read as follows:
16.28.010: Those certain documents, copies of each being on file in the Office of the City Clerk, and
designated as follows, are adopted by reference and made a part of this Code, to the same effect as if set out
herein in full:

(A)  Uniform Plumbing Code, [2018] 2024 Edition, including its Standards and Appendices,

except as otherwise indicated, designated as Part 1 of this Chapter; and

B) A document entitled “Southern Nevada Amendments to the [2018] 2024 Uniform Plumbing

Code, CLV Amended.” adding to, deleting from and amending the Uniform Plumbing Code, [2018] 2024

Edition, designated as Part 2 of this Chapter. This document includes amendments specific to the City of

Las Vegas. as indicated therein.

SECTION 2: The document entitled “Southern Nevada Amendments to the 2024

Uniform Plumbing Code, CLV Amended” is attached hereto.

SECTION 3:  Ordinance No. 6638, the “Uniform Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition,” and the
«“Southern Nevada Amendments to the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code,” as amended, are hereby repealed in
their entirety.

SECTION 4:  This Ordinance shall be effective as of January 5, 2026.

SECTION 5:  Ifany section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase




10

11

12

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

24

25

26

in this ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective by
any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity or effectiveness of the
remaining portions of this ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council of the City of Las Vegas hereby
declares that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase
thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs,

sentences, clauses or phrases be declared unconstitutional, invalid or ineffective.

SECTION 6: Whenever in this ordinance any act is prohibited or is made or declared to
be unlawful or an offense or a misdemeanor, or whenever in this ordinance the doing of any act is required
or the failure to do any act is made or declared to be unlawful or an offense or a misdemeanor, the doing of
such prohibited act or the failure to do any such required act shall constitute a misdemeanor and upon
conviction thereof, shall be punished by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 or by imprisonment for a term of
not more than six months, or by any combination of such fine and imprisonment. Any day of any violation

of this ordinance shall constitute a separate offense.

SECTION 7:  All ordinances or parts of ordinances or sections, subsections, phrases,
sentences, clauses or paragraphs contained in the Municipal Code of the City of Las Vegas, Nevada, 1983

Edition, in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

PASSED, ADOPTED and APPROVED this /(** day ¢ a/? 7, 2005.

APPROVED:

By __, f /
SHEMLEYBERKILEY, Mayor—

7

2

ATTEST: Brian Knudsen, Mayor Pro-Tem

7IST{I\;LUAI\M D. HOLMES;MMC

City Clerk
APPROVED AS TO FORM:

JA))  hrs
Val Steed, 7 Date
Deputy City Attorney




N

O e N Y N b~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

The above and foregoing ordinance was first proposed and read by title to the City
Council on the 2" day of July, 2025, and referred to a committee for recommendation;
hereafter the committee reported favorably on said ordinance on the 16" day of July,
2025, which as a regular meeting of said Council; that at said regular meeting, the

proposed ordinance was read by title to the City Council and adopted by the following

vote:
VOTING "AYE": Mayor Pro Tem Knudsen, and Councilmembers, Seaman,
Diaz, Allen-Palenske, Brune and Summers-Armstrong
VOTING "NAY": None
EXCUSED: Mayor Berkley
THOSE NOT VOTING: None
SAFEEEY BERKEEY; Mayor
ian Knudsen, r Pro-Tem
ATTEST: Brian Knudsen, Mayor P ‘ Te
|-V

ALl
DR(/LUAI@\I D. HOLMES, MMC City Clerk




AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

STATE OF NEVADA)
COUNTY OF CLARK) SS:

LV CITY CLERK
ATTN: ARLENE

495 S MAIN 8T

LAS VEGAS NV 89101

Las Vegas Review-Journal

1111 W. Bonanza Road
Las Vegas, NV 89106

Account #
Order ID

Leslie McCormick, being 1st duty swomn, deposes and says: That she is the Legal Clerk
for the Las Vegas Review-Journal/lLas Vegas Sun, daily newspaper regularly issued,
published and circulated in the Clark County, Las Vegas, Nevada and that the
advertisement, a true copy attached for, was continuously published in said Las Vegas
Review-Journal/Las Vegas Sun, in 1 edition(s) of said newspaper issued from 07/03/2025

to 07/03/2025, on the following day(s):

07/03/2025

LEGAL ADVERTISEMENT REPRESENTATIVE

Subscribed and sworn to before me on this July 3, 2025

o S

LINDA ESPINGZA
Notary Public, State of Nevada

¥ My Appointment No. 24-8178-04

Expires: July 14, 2028

104115
337798

Bili NO.2025-23

AN ORDINANCE TO ADOPT THE
2024 EDETION OF THE UNIFORM
PLUMBING. CODE, TOGETHER
WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO,
AND TO PROVIDE FOR OTHER
RELATED'MAT TERS.

Proposed by Seth T Floyd,
Director of Commumity

Somwnary: Adppts the 2024
Edition ~ .of ~the UYniform
Plumhbing Code, together with
amendments thereto.

At the Eity Councilmeeting of
July2,20725

BILL NO. 2025:23 WAS READ BY
TITLE AND 'REFERRED TO A
RECOMBENDING COMMITIEE

COPIES. OF THE COMPLEIE
ORDINANCE ARE = AVAILABLE
FOR. PUBLIC INFORMATION .IN
THE QFFICE OF THE CITY CLERK,
2ND, FLOOR, 485 SOUTH MAIN
STREET, LAS VEGAS, NEVADA

PUEB: July 3, 2025
LV Review:Joiirnzal

Page 1 of 1



LAS VEGES Las Vegas Review-Journal
REVIEW-JOURNAL 1111 W, Bonanza Road

, s Las Vegas, NV 89106

AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

STATE OF NEVADA)

COUNTY OF CLARK) SS:
LV CITY CLERK ' Account # 104115
ATTN: ARLENE Order ID 338561
495 S MAIN ST
LAS VEGAS NV 89101

Leslie McCormick, being 1st duty sworn, deposes and says: That she is the Legal Clerk
for the Las Vegas Review-Journal/Las Vegas Sun, daily newspaper regularly issued,
published and circulated in the Clark County, Las Vegas, Nevada and that the
advertisement, a true copy attached for, was continuously published in said Las Vegas
Review-Journal/Las Vegas Sun, in 1 edition(s) of said newspaper issued from 07/19/2025

to 07/19/2025, on the following day(s):

07/19/2025

LEGAL ADVERTISEMENT REPRESENTATIVE

Subscribed and sworn to before me on this July 19, 2025

2/ “Mﬁ%

LINDA ESPINOZA
Notary Public, State of Nevada
My Appoiniment No. 24-9178-01
Expires: July 14, 2028

Page 1 of 1



SOUTHERN NEVADA AMENDMENTS
TO THE
2024 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
CLV AMENDED

Version Dated: February 24, 2025



Preface

This document was developed by the Southern Nevada Building Officials’ (SNBO) Plumbing and
Mechanical Code Committee and presents amendments to the 2024 Uniform Plumbing Code
(UPC) with City of Las Vegas amendments as published by the International Association of
Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO).

Participation in the 2024 Plumbing and Mechanical Code Committee was open to all interested
parties. However, voting on amendments proposals was limited to one vote each for seven
Southern Nevada municipalities (Clark County, Henderson, Las Vegas, North Las Vegas, Boulder
City, Pahrump, and Mesquite), the Clark County School District, and three industry
representatives. All committee proceedings were conducted in accordance with Robert’s Rules

of Order.

The recommended amendments contained herein are not code unless adopted and codified by
governmental jurisdictions. These amendments are not intended to prevent the use of any
material or method of construction not specifically prescribed herein, provided any alternates have
been approved and their use authorized by the Building Official. This document may be copied
and used in whole or in part without permission or approval from the organizations listed on the

cover page.

Page 2 of 18 February 24, 2025



Table of Contents

Chapter 1, AdmIniStration ............cccoiiiii i 5
Section 207.0, DefiNItIONS ......cieiiiiiiei it 5
ST o110 ¢ TR 16 0 S PSPPSR 5
LY o110 ) o 1 L0y 2 PO 5
SCHON 407 . 2.1 oot 6
LY=o (o) 1 L A FEUE U OSSO PO PR PRPPPPPPPPPPPRN 6
LY=o (0] (1L 011 FUUUU USSP PO PPPPPPPPPRPI 6
LSY=Yeu 1) 110 0 PSP PP RPPPPPPS 6
LY=o (o) 1 1 2 PO PSP PPPPPPPPPRPRN 7
LY=o 110 1 1 5t 1 SO PRP PRSP 7
LSY=You 110 11 3t o Jc F U PP PPPPPPPPPPPPPRPPPPPPPS 7
LY=o £10) 1 - 3 £ o7 T PRSP PPPPPPIER 7
LS Y=Yext (o) 110 Bt K T T Bt PO PRPTP PR PRPPP 8
Y=Y o 110 1 L 722 O T UU U PP PPPPPPPPPPPT PP 8
SY=Yo170) 1oL O T P PP PP PPPUPPPPPPFPPRPRNP 8
LS Y=Ye, 170 1 o101 1 Ty [P OSSP PPPPPPP P 8
LOY=You 110 8 1] 0 Lo TR 207 SO PPPPPUUPUPPPPPPPPRPRS 9
LST=Yout[o) 1 1oL 015 o T I RO PP 9
LSY=You1 (o) 1151 01 V22 (PRSP PP PPPS 9
SECHON BOB.4.2. ..o ee ettt e e e e e e e e e e s nn e et e ae e E et a e 9
SECHON BOB.5....eeeeeeeeee et eeeeeee et ee e e e e e saa e s ei e e e s aa s e s e e ne e e e s et 10
LSY=Yei (o) 13 172K O PPN RPPPPS 10
LSY=Yes 170 LI 4 0L Y FO U OO PP PPPPPPPPPPPRPPPPPPR 10
LSY=Yes 170 (N4 0% U PP PO PP POPPPPPPPPPSPPRPPPS 11
LSY=You 1703 4 Tt 10 [P OPPP PP PPPPRPPPPPIPPIE 11
LSY=You 170 (I A 10 15 I S PP PPITSPIEEPE 12
LS Y=Yein (o) ¢ At 1O 307 PP PSS PRPRPF PP TPRPPRERES 12
LYo (10 £ T 0 I I PPN PPPPRRERRE 12
LYY e i0) 8 Mo L DR I DU PR PPPP PRI 13

Page 3 of 18 February 24, 2025



(e [0) 1 1o 10 Vs [T 13

LYo os 170 R TS0 S [ OO PP 13
LYoV (e] 1T T PP PTPPPR 13
LSY=To170) T 1010 7257 TP PP PPPTOTP 14
LSY=Yoyi o) 1 B L0101 7K O PP P S UPRPPP PR 15
ST x10) 3 T L0 2 T il U PSSR PR PP PPPP PR 15
ESY=yor110) 1T L0 0 302 P PPPP PP 16
SECHON 110702 oo 16
Y=Y (o) 0 Tt b L0 I O PSPPI 16
LSY=Yox (7o ¢ N b L0 IR 0 O PP PP 16
LSY=Yetu1o) 1 Tt b L0 I PSPPI 17
LYo ox 1o 11 Tt b L0 IS PSP PP 17
LST=Yes 17011 T b L0 e (5 PRSP PPPPPPY 17
LSY=Yex 110 4 T 22 0 1 1O PP PP PPPPSPPPPPO 17
LY=o 1o 1 T 2 TR 1 O PSP 17
(03 111 o1 = e T PSPPI SR IR PR TS 18
CRAPTET T4 ...t 18
(03 1 7= o1 = K OSSP PP TP 18
Table 1701.1, Reference Standards ... 18

* - City of Las Vegas Amendments

Page 4 of 18 February 24, 2025



Chapter 1, Administration

Delete Chapter 1, with the exception of Sections 101.0, 101.1, 101.2, 101.3 and 101.4 and replace
Section 101.5 and add Section 101.6 to read as follows:

101.5 Plumbing Licensing Provision. Provision for licensing shall be determined by the
Administration Provision of Authority Having Jurisdiction.

101.6 Appendices. The following appendices are specifically adopted, Appendix A, Appendix B,
Appendix C, Appendix D, Appendix E, Appendix G, Appendix I, Appendix J, Appendix K,
Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix Q, and Appendix R.

Section 207.0, Definitions

Revise as follows:

Expansion Tank. A vessel used to protect closed systems from excessive pressure.

Section 310.4

Amend section 310.4 by deleting the second sentence and adding a new exception to read as
follows:

310.4 Except as hereinafter provided in Sections 908.0 through 911.0, no vent pipe shall be used
as a soil or waste pipe, nor shall a soil or waste pipe be used as a vent.

Exception: Single stack DWV systems may be used provided they are designed by a
Nevada registered Mechanical Engineer and approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

Section 401.2
Add new Section 401.2.1 and exception to read as follows:

401.2.1 Water Sense Program. Lavatory faucets, urinals, water closets and showerheads
installed in every residential, commercial, or industrial structure on which construction begins on
or after January 1, 2020 shall be certified to EPA Water Sense — 2007 High Efficiency Lavatory
Faucet Specification, EPA Water Sense — 2009 Specification for Flushing Urinals, EPA Water
Sense — 2014 Specification for Tank-Type Toilets, EPA Water Sense — 2015 Specification for
Flushometer-Valve Water Closets, EPA Water Sense — 2018 Specification for Showerheads, as
applicable. All other plumbing fixtures shall have consumptions rates as required by other sections
of this code, as applicable.

Exception: If the Water Sense program modifies the requirements for a plumbing fixture
to be certified under the Water Sense program, a plumbing fixture that was certified under
the previous requirements shall be deemed certified for use under the Water Sense

Page 5 of 18 February 24, 2025



program for period of 12 months following the modification of the requirements for
certification.

Section 407.2.1
Revise Subsection 407.2.1 to read as follows:

407.2.1 Maximum Flow Rates. The maximum flow rate for public lavatory faucets shall not
exceed 0.5 gpm at 60 psi (1.9 L/m at 414 kPa) and 1.5 gpm at 60 psi (5.7 L/m at 414kPa) for
private lavatory faucets.

Section 407.4
Revise Section 407.4 in its entirety to read as follows:

407.4 Public Lavatories. Self-closing or metering faucets shall be installed on lavatories in public
restrooms. Multiple faucets that are activated from a single point shall not be installed.

Section 408.3
Revise Subsection 408.3 to read as follows:

408.3 Showerheads. Showerheads shall have a maximum flow rate of no more than 2.0 gpm at
80 psi. (7.5L/m at 552 kPa). Body sprays shall have a flow rate of not more than 2.0 gpm at 80
psi (7.5L/m at 552 kPa).

Section 411.0
Revise Sections 411.2 and 411.2.2 to read as follows:

411.2 Water Consumption Water closets shall have a maximum consumption not to exceed 1.28
gallons (4.8 liters) of water per flush. A timing device or other mechanism which will automatically
flush a water closet periodically or continually is prohibited.

411.2.2 Flushometer Valve Activated Water Closets. Flushometer valve activated water
closets shall have a maximum flush volume of 1.28 gallons (4.8 liters) of water per flush. A timing
device or other mechanism which will automatically flush a water closet periodically or continually

is prohibited.

Page 6 of 18 February 24, 2025



Section 4121

Revise Section 412.1 to read as follows:

412.1 Application. Urinals shall comply with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME A112.19.19,,
or CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124, Urinals shall have an average water consumption not to exceed 0.5
gallons (1.9 L) of water per flush. A timing device or other mechanism which will automatically
flush a urinal periodically or continually is prohibited.

Section 415.2

Revise section 415.2 as follows:

Section 415.2 Drinking Fountain Alternatives. Drinking fountain alternatives shall be provided
for the type of occupancy and in the minimum number as required by the currently adopted
Building Code.

Section 418.3
Amend Subsection, 418.3 ltem 2 as follows:

418.3 Item (2) Commerecial kitchens.

Section 418.3
Add a new Subsections, 418.3 Item 5 and Iltem 6, as follows:

418.3 Item (5) All Fire Pump rooms shall be provided with a (3) inch (76 mm) minimum floor drain
which must be connected to an approved trap primer.

418.3 Item (8) Toilet facilities serving public pools or spas, regardless of the quantity and type of
fixtures shall be provided with a floor drain with trap seal protection in accordance with UPC
section 1007.0 as amended, to prevent the accumulation of standing water. At least one hose bib
or potable water source capable of connecting a hose shall be required to facilitate cleaning of

the toilet facility.

Page 7 of 18 February 24, 2025



Section 418.3.1*
Add new section 418.3.1

418.3.1 Prohibited Locations. Floor drains shall not be installed in exterior trash enclosures
regardless if they are covered or uncovered.

Exception: Exterior trash compactors provided with a floor drain or indirect waste receptor
connected to a grease interceptor in accordance with Section 1014.1 shall be provided with a

lockable cover.

Section 422.0

Delete Section 422.1 through 422.5 and Table 422.1 in their entirety and replace 422.1 to read
as follows:

422.1 Fixture Count. Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of occupancy and in the
minimum number as required by the currently adopted Building Code.

Section 507.5
Revise code section 507.5 to read as follows:

Where a water heater is installed in an attic, in or on an attic ceiling assembly, floor-ceiling
assembly, floor-subfloor assembly or where damage results from a leaking water heater, a
watertight pan of corrosion-resistant materials shall be installed beneath the water heater in
accordance with the following:

(1) The drainage pan shall be provided with not less than % of an inch diameter drain to an
approved location. The terminating end of the drainpipe shall be readily visible.

(2) The drainage pan shall be not less than 1-1/2 inches in depth.

(3) Where a drainage pan pipe is installed, the material of the piping shall be approved for
use with the liquid being discharged.

(4) Discharge from a relief valve into a drainage pan shall be prohibited.

Exception 1: A drainage pan shall not be required for a tankless water heater installed in a
readily accessible location.

Exception 2: A drainage pan shall not be required for a point of use water heater.

Section 508.3.1
Revise Section 508.3.1 to read as follows:

508.3.1 Access. Buildings of more than 15 feet in height shall have an interior or exterior means
of access to the roof, in accordance with section 508.3.2 as applicable.

Page 8 of 18 February 24, 2025



Section 508.3.2
Add additional paragraph to Section 508.3.2, as follows:

508.3.2 Access Type
Permanent ladders required by Section 508.3.1 or exterior ladders shall be constructed in

accordance with the following:

(1) Side railings shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) above the roof or parapet wall.
(2) Landings shall not exceed 18 feet (5486 mm) apart measured from the finished grade.

(3) Width shall be not less than 14 inches (356 mm) on center.
(4) Rungs spacing shall not exceed 12 inches (305 mm) on center, and each rung shall be

capable of supporting a 300 pound (136.1 kg) load.
(5) Toe space shall be not less than 6 inches (152 mm).

Exceptions:
1. Permanent exterior ladders providing roof access need not extend closer than

eight (8) feet (2438 mm) to the finish grade.
2. A portable ladder may be used for access for a Group R Division 3 and 4 and U

occupancies.
3. Permanent ladders for equipment access need not be provided at parapets or
walls less than thirty (30) inches (762mm) in height.
Section 509.6.1
Add an exception to Subsection 509.6.1, item #1, to read as follows:
Exception: A single-family residence having gas vents twelve (12) inches (300 mm) in size

or smaller with listed caps shall be permitted to be terminated in accordance with Figure
509.6.1, provided they are at least four (4) feet (1.2 m) from a vertical wall or similar

obsfruction.

Items (2) through (7) remain unchanged.
Section 601.2.1

Add an exception to Subsection 601.2.1 as follows:

Exception: Hot water shall not be required at public park lavatories.

Section 603.4.2

Revise Subsection 603.4.2, as follows:

Page 9 of 18 February 24, 2025



603.4.2 The premise owner or responsible person shall have the backflow prevention assembly
tested by a certified backflow assembly tester at the time of installation, repair, or relocation and
not less than on an annual schedule thereafter, or more often when required by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction. The certified tester shall leave a copy of their backflow certification on site
along with a copy of the certification of each device tested._The periodic testing shall be performed
in accordance with the procedures referenced in ASSE/IAPMO/ANSI Series 5000 by a tester
qualified in accordance with those standards. The field test kit used shall comply with ASSE 1064.

Section 608.5

Add an additional Requirement to Section 608.5 Discharge Piping, as follows:

608.5 Discharge Piping

9) For relief valves located inside a building, provide a drain of galvanized steel,
hard-drawn copper piping and fittings, CPVC, PP or flexible corrugated connectors
complying with 604.0 or listed relief valve drain tube with fittings that will not reduce
the internal bore of the pipe or tubing (straight lengths as opposed to coils) and
shall extend from the valve to the outside of the building or to an approved location.
Temperature and Pressure Relief (T&P) drains shall discharge to the exterior of
the building unless the manufacturers listing prevents this termination. T&P drains
may discharge through an air gap into a secondary clothes washer port, or through
an air gap in a floor sink, floor mounted mop sink or a floor drain equipped with a
listed funnel, provided they are installed in accordance with section 804.1.

Section 612.0

Delete Section 612.0 Residential Fire Sprinklers Systems in its entirety

Section 704.3
Revise Section 704.3, as follows:

704.3 Pot sinks, scullery sinks, dishwashing sinks, silverware sinks, commercial dishwashing
machines, and other similar fixtures shall drain indirectly to the drainage systems by means of an

air gap.

Page 10 of 18 February 24, 2025



Section 707.1

Add a footnote fo Table 707.1, as follows:

TABLE 707.1
CLEANQUTS NOTE 1
SIZE OF PIPE SIZE OF CLEANOUT THREADS
(inches) (inches) (per inches)
1% 1% 11%
2 1% 11 %
2% 2% 8
3 2% 8
4 & larger 3% 8

For Sl units: 1 inch =25 mm

NOTES:
1.Where a 2-1/2” (inch) cleanout is required, a 2 (inch) cleanout may be used for horizontal
branch waste lines.

Section 710.1
Revise Section 710.1 to read as follows:

710.1 Backflow Protection. Fixtures installed on a floor level that is lower than the next upstream
manhole cover of the public, or private sewer shall be protected from backflow of sewage by
installing an approved type of backwater valve. Fixtures on such floor level that are not below the
next upstream manhole cover shall not be required to be protected by a backwater valve. Other
than a single dwelling unit served by an individual sewer, fixtures on floor levels above such
elevation shall not discharge through the backwater valve. Cleanouts for drains that pass through
the backwater valve shall be clearly identified with a permanent label stating “backwater valve
downstream.”

Page 11 of 18 February 24, 2025



Section 710.14*

Add new section 710.14:

710.14 Elevator Pit Sump Pump Discharge Locations. Elevator sump pump discharge piping
shall discharge to one of the following locations:

@) To a sand oil interceptor in accordance with Section 1016.0.

) To the exterior of the building with a placard or signage at the point of discharge that
reads as follows; “Caution; Non Potable, Do Not Drink. Elevator Sump Pump Discharge
Only. Drain To Suitable Container for Proper Offsite Disposal’. Point of discharge on the
exterior of the building shall be provided with a shut off valve and a threaded cap for
standard hose connection. Hose bibs are not permitted to be used as a shut off valve.

Section 710.2

Revise 710.2 and add 710.2.1 as follows:

710.2 Sewage Discharge. Drainage piping serving fixtures that are located below the crown level
of the main sewer shall discharge into an approved watertight sump or receiving tank, so located
as to receive the sewage or liquid wastes by gravity. From such sump or receiving tank, the
sewage or other liquid wastes shall be lifted and discharged into the building drain or building
sewer by approved ejectors, pumps, or other equally efficient approved mechanical devices.

710.2.1 Prohibited Discharges. Non-sewage liquid wastes, including rain, surface, or
subsurface water shall be a prohibited discharge to the building sewer or as determined
by the Authority Having Jurisdiction and in accordance with Chapter 11 Storm Drainage.

Section 801.3.2
Revise Subsection 801.3.2, as follows:

801.3.2 Walk-in Coolers: For walk-in coolers, floor drains shall be permitted to be connected to
a separate drainage line discharging into an outside receptor. The flood-level rim of the receptor
shall be not less than six inches (152 mm) lower than the lowest floor drain. Such floor drains
shall be trapped and individually vented. Cleanouts shall be provided at ninety 90 degree (1.57
rad) turns and shall be accessibly located. Such waste shall discharge through an airgap into a
trapped and vented receptor, except that full-size airgap is required where the indirect waste pipe
is under vacuum. '

Page 12 0f 18 February 24, 2025



Section 801.3.4

Add a new section 801.3.4 to read as follows:

801.3.4 Floor Sinks. Flood level rim of floor sinks shall be installed with the finished floor, sealed
with no gaps, and shall be accessible for cleaning.

Section 804.1
Revise Section 804.1 by adding a new second paragraph, as follows:

Indirect waste piping other than the discharge from the clothes washer may be terminated into a
listed clothes washer box. The second port, on a multiport box shall be permanently connected
to the vertical receptor standpipe via a wye branch fitting.

Section 904.1
Revise Section 904.1 Size, retaining the exception, to read as follows:

904.1. Size. The size of vent piping shall be determined from its length and the total number of
fixture units connected thereto, in accordance with Table 703.2. The diameter of an individual
vent shall be not less than 1 % inches (32mm) not less than one-half the diameter of the drain to
which it is connected. In addition, the drainage piping of each building and each connection to a
public sewer or a private sewage disposal system shall be vented by means of one or more vent
pipes, the aggregate cross-sectional area of which shall be not less than that of the largest
required building sewer as determined from Table 703.2. Vent pipes from fixtures located
upstream from pumps, ejectors, or other devices that obstruct the free flow of air and other gases
between the building sewer and the outside atmosphere shall not be used for meeting the cross-
sectional area venting requirements of this section.

Section 913
Add new section 913.0 Air Admittance Valves

913.0 Air Admittance Valves

913.1 General. Vent systems utilizing air admittance valves shall comply with this section. Stack-
type air admittance valves shall conform to ASSE 1050. Individual and branch-type air admittance
valves shall conform to ASSE 1051. Air admittance valves shall meet all performance standards

of: ASSE 1050, ASSE 1051.

913.2 Installation. The valves shall be installed in accordance with the requirements of this
section and the manufacturer’s instructions. Air admittance valves shall be installed after the DWV
testing required by Section 318.0 or 712.0 has been performed.

913.3 Where permitted. Individual, branch and circuit vents shall be permitted to terminate with
a connection to an individual or branch-type air admittance valve in accordance with Section

Page 13 of 18 February 24, 2025



913.3.1. Stack vents and vent stacks shall be permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance
valves in accordance with Section 813.3.2.

913.3.1 Horizontal branches. Individual and branch-type air admittance valves shall vent only
fixtures that are on the same floor level and connect to a horizontal branch drain. Where the
horizontal branch is located more than four branch intervals from the top of the stack, the
horizontal branch shall be provided with a relief vent that shall connect to a vent stack or stack
vent or extend outdoors to the open air. The relief vent shall connect to the horizontal branch
drain between the stack and the most downstream fixture drain connected to the horizontal branch
drain. The relief vent shall be sized in accordance with Table 703.2 and installed in accordance
with Section 905. The relief vent shall be permitted to serve as the vent for other fixtures.

913.3.2 Stack. Stack-type air admittance valves shall be prohibited from serving as the vent
terminal for vent stacks or stack vents that serve drainage stacks having more than six branch
intervals.

913.4 Location. Individual and branch-type air admittance valves shall be located not less than
4 inches (102 mm) above the horizontal branch drain or fixture drain being vented. Stack-type air
admittance valves shall be located not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above the flood level rim of
the highest fixture being vented. The air admittance valve shall be located within the maximum
developed length permitted for the vent. The air admittance valve shall be installed not less than
6 inches (152 mm) above insulation materials.

913.5 Access and ventilation. Access shall be provided to all air admittance valves. Such valves
shall be installed in a location that allows air to enter the valve.

913.6 Size. The air admittance valve shall be rated in accordance with the standard for the size
of the vent to which the valve is connected.

913.7 Vent required. Within each plumbing system, the drainage piping of each building and
each connection to public sewer or a private sewage disposal system shall be vented by means
of one or more vent pipes, the aggregate cross-sectional area of which shall be not less than that
of the largest required building sewer and shall extend outdoors to the open air.

913.8 Prohibited installations. Air admittance valves shall not be installed in non-neutralized
special waste systems. Air admittance valves shall not be located in spaces utilized as supply or
return air plenums. Air admittance valves shall not be used to vent sumps or tanks except where
the vent system for the sump or tank has been designed by an engineer. Air admittance valves
shall not be installed on outdoor vent terminals for the sole purpose of reducing clearances to
gravity air intakes or mechanical air intakes.

Section 1007.2

Revise section 1007.2 to allow barrier trap seals, designed and approved to the ASSE 1072
standard. Add exception to 1007.2, as follows:

1007.2 Exception: barrier trap seals that comply with ASSE 1072 may be used in floor drains
and installed according to the manufacturer's instructions.

Page 14 of 18 February 24, 2025



Section 1008.0
Amend Section 1008.1 to read as follows:

1008.1 General

Where building traps are to be installed, each building trap shall be provided with a cleanout and
with a relieving vent or fresh-air intake on the inlet side of the trap, which shall be at least one-
half the diameter of the drain to which it connects. Such relieving vent or fresh-air intake shall be
carried above grade and terminate in a screened outlet located outside the building.

Section 1014.1*

Revise section 1014.1, to read as follows:

1014.1 General. Where it is determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction that waste
pretreatment is required, an approved type of grease interceptor(s) shall comply with ASME
A112.14.3, ASME A112.14.4, CSA B481, ANSI/CAN/IAPMO Z1001, PDI G-101, or PDI G-102,
and sized in accordance with Section 1014.2.1 or Section 1014.3.6, shall be installed in
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions to receive the drainage from fixtures
or equipment that produce grease-laden waste. Grease-laden waste fixtures shall include, but
not be limited to, sinks and drains, such as floor drains and floor sinks in grease generating
areas, scullery sinks, multiple compartment sinks, mop sinks, service sinks, soup kettles and
similar cooking equipment, interior and exterior trash compactors, trash can wash areas, and
similar fixtures or equipment in serving establishments, such as restaurants, cafes, lunch
counters, cafeterias, bars and clubs, hotels, hospitals, sanitariums, factory or school kitchens, or
other establishments as regulated by Title 14.17 of the City of Las Vegas Municipal Code where
grease is introduced into the drainage or sewage system in quantities that can effect line
stoppage or hinder sewage treatment or private sewage disposal systems, A combination of
hydromechanical, gravity grease interceptors and engineered systems shall be allowed to meet
this code and other applicable requirements of the Authority Having Jurisdiction where space or
existing physical constraints of existing buildings necessitate such installations. A grease
interceptor shall not be required for individual dwelling units or private living quarters. Water
closets, urinals, and other plumbing fixtures conveying human waste shall not drain into or
through the grease interceptor.

Informational Note: Title 14.17 of the City of Las Vegas Municipal Code establishes
requirements for commercial businesses to provide a grease interceptor where there is a
potential to discharge materials that can float or settle in the sanitary sewer systems. This
applies to facilities where preparation, manufacturing, processing of food or
washing/sanitizing of dishes or equipment occurs.

Page 15 0f 18 February 24, 2025



Section 1014.3.2*
Revise section 1014.3.2, to read as follows and retain sections 1014.3.2.1 and 1014.3.2.2:

1014.3.2 Waste Discharge Requirements. Waste discharge in establishments from fixtures
and equipment which contain grease, including but not limited to, scullery sinks, pot and pan
sinks, dishwashers, soup kettles, and floor drains located in areas where grease-containing
materials exist, shall be drained into the sanitary waste through the interceptor where approved
by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

Section 1101.2
Amend Section 1101.2, as follows:

1101.2 Where Required.

Roofs, paved areas, yards, courts, courtyards, vent shafts, light wells, or similar areas having
rainwater, shall be drained into a separate storm sewer system, or to some other place of disposal
satisfactory to the Authority Having Jurisdiction. In the case of one-and two-family dwellings,
storm water shall be permitted to be discharged on flat areas, such as streets or lawns, so long
as the storm water shall flow away from the building and away from adjoining property, and shall
not create a nuisance.

Exception: For townhouses and two-family dwellings, as defined in the International
Residential Code, storm water may be discharged onto an adjoining property that is
maintained by a common interest community as stipulated in the Covenants, Conditions
and Restrictions (CC&Rs) approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

Section 1101.6
Amend section 1101.6 to read as follows:

1101.6 Subsoil Drains Where required by the geotechnical engineer or the authority having
jurisdiction, subsoil drains shall be provided around the perimeter of buildings having basements,
cellars, or crawl spaces or floors below grade. Such subsoil drains shall be permitted to be
positioned inside or outside of the footing, shall be of perforated, or open-jointed approved drain
tile or pipe not less than three (3) inches (80 mm) in diameter, and shall be laid in gravel, slag,
crushed rock, approved three-quarter (3/4) inch (19.1 mm) crushed recycled glass aggregate, or
other approved porous material with not less than (4) inches (102 mm) surrounding the pipe.
Filter media shall be provided for exterior subsoil piping.

Section 1101.10

Delete section 1101.10 in its entirety.

Page 16 of 18 February 24, 2025



~ Section 1101.11

Delete section 1101.11 in its entirety.

Section 1101.15

Delete section 1101.15 in its entirety.

Section 1101.16.2

Delete section 1101.16.2 in its entirety.

Section 1201.0
Add a new subsection 1201.2 to Section 1201.0 General fo read as follows:

1201.2 Southern Nevada shall be considered a dry gas condition having a moisture and
hydrocarbon dew point below any normal temperature to which the gas piping is in an exposed
area, unless specified by the local gas purveyor.

Section 1210.1.6
Revise Section 1210.1.6, as follows:

1210.1.6 Piping Underground Beneath Buildings. All gas piping under a slab shall be capable
of being removed and replaced without disturbing the slab. Where gas piping is installed
underground beneath any building, structure or appurtenance including, but not limited to,
porches and steps, whether covered or uncovered, breezeways, roofed porte-cocheres, roofed
patios, carports, covered walks, and covered driveways, the piping shall be either of the following:

(1) Encased in an approved conduit that shall be not less than one-half (1/2) inch (15mm)
larger than the outside diameter of the gas piping, not less than Schedule 40 pipe, designed
to withstand the imposed loads and installed in accordance with Section 1210.1.6.1 or

Section 1210.1.6.2.
(2) A piping/encasement system listed for installation beneath buildings. [NFPA 54:7.1.6]

1210.1.6.1 Conduit with One End Terminating Outdoors. The conduit shall extend into an
accessible portion of the building and, at the point where the conduit terminates in the building,
the space between the conduit and the gas piping shall be sealed to prevent the possible
entrance of any gas leakage. Where the end sealing is of a type that retains the full pressure
of the pipe, the conduit shall be designed for the same pressure as the pipe. The conduit shall
extend at least 12 inches (305 mm) outside the building, be vented outdoors above finished

Page 17 of 18 February 24, 2025



ground level, and be installed so as to prevent the entrance of water and insects. [NFPA
54:7.1.6.1]

1210.1.6.2 Conduit with Both Ends Terminating Indoors. Where the conduit originates and
terminates within the same building, the conduit shall originate and terminate in an accessible
portion of the building and shall not be sealed. [NFPA 54.7.1.6.2]

Chapter 13

Delete Chapter 13 in its entirety, except for section 1303.8.

Chapter 14

Delete Chapter 14 in its entirety.

Chapter 15

Delete Sections 1501 through 1505, and revise section 1501 as follows:

1501.0

1501.1 General: The provisions of sections 1501.0 and 1506.0 of this chapter shall not be allowed
in residential buildings and shall apply to the installation, construction, alteration, and repair of
reclaimed water systems intended to supply uses such as water closets urinals, trap primers for
floor drains, floor sinks, irrigation, industrial processes, water features and other uses approved
by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Potable water supplied as makeup water in these systems
shall be protected against back-pressure and back-siphonage in accordance with Sections 602.0
and 603.0. Reclaimed (recycled) water shall be prohibited for use in evaporative cooler systems.

(Sections 1502,1503,1504, and 1505 are deleted)

Table 1701.1, Reference Standards
Amend Table 1701.1 Referenced Standards by adding the following:

ASSE 1050-2021 Performance Requirements for Stack Air Admittance Valves for Sanitary
Drainage Systems.

ASSE 1051-2021 Performance Requirements for Individual and Branch Type Air Admittance
Valves for Sanitary Drainage Systems

ASSE 1072-2020 Performance Requirements for Trap Seal Protection for Floor Drains.

Page 18 of 18 February 24, 2025



