
1 BILL  N0.  2025-22

2 ORDINANCEN0,  6915

3

4

AN  ORDINANCE  TO ADOPT  THE  2024  EDITION  OF THE  {JNIFORM  MECHANICAL  CODE,

TOGETHER  WITH  AMENDMENTS  THERETO,  AND  TO  PROVIDE  FOR  OTHER  RELATED

MATTERS.

5

6

Proposed  by:  Seth  T. Floyd,  Director  of

Community  Development

Summary:  Adopts  the  2024  Edition  of the

Uniform  Mechanical  Code,  together  with

amendments  thereto.

7 THE  CITY  COUNCIL  OF THE  CITY  OF LAS  VEGAS  DOES  HEREBY  ORDAIN  AS

8 FOLLOWS:

9 SECTION  1:  Title  16, Chapter  24, Section  10, of  the  Municipal  Code  of  the  City  of  Las

10 Vegas,  Nevada,  1983  Edition,  is hereby  amended  to read  as follows:

11 16.24.010: Those  certain  documents,  copies  of  each  being  on file  in the  office  of  the City  Clerk,  and

12 designated  as follows,  are adopted  by reference  and  made  a part  of  tliis  Code,  to the  same  effect  as if  set out

13 herein  in  full:

14 (A)  Uniform  Mechanical  Code,  [2018]  2024  Edition,  designated  as Part 1 of  this

15 Chapter;  and

16 (B)  A document  entitled  "Southern  Nevada  Amendments  to the [2018]  2024  Uniform

17 Mechanical  Code,"  adding  to, deleting  from  and amending  the Unifortn  Mechanical  Code,  [2018]  2024

18 Edition,  designated  as Part  2 of  this  Cliapter.

19 SECTION2:  The  document  entitled  "Southern  Nevada  Amendments  to  the  2024

20 Uniform  Mechanical  Code"  is attached  to this  Ordinance.

21 SECTION  3: Ordinance No. 6631 the "Uniform  Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition,"  and

22 the "Southern  Nevada  Amendments  to tlie  2018  Uniform  Mechanical  Code"  are hereby  repealed  in their

23

24

entirety.

SECTION  4:  This  Ordinance  shall  be effective  as of  January  5, 2026.

25 SECTION  5: Ifany  section,  subsection,  subdivision,  paragraph,  sentence,  clause  orphrase

26 in this  ordinance  or  any  part  tliereof  is for  any  reason  held  to be unconstitutional  or  invalid  or  ineffective  by



l  any court  of  competent  jurisdiction,  such decision  shall  not affect  the validity  or effectiveness  of  the

2 remaining  portions  of  this  ordinance  or  any  part  thereof.  The  City  Council  of  the City  of  Las  Vegas  hereby

3 declares  that  it would  have  passed  each  section,  subsection,  subdivision,  paragraph,  sentence,  clause  or  phrase

4 thereof  irrespective  of  the fact  that  any one or more  sections,  subsections,  subdivisions,  paragraphs,

5 sentences,  clauses  or  phrases  be declared  unconstitutional,  invalid  or  ineffective.

SECTION  6:  Whenever  in this  ordinance  any  act  is prohibited  or is made  or declared  to

7 be unlawfut  or  an offense  or  a misdemeanor,  or  wlienever  in this  ordinance  the doing  of  any  act  is required

8 or  the  failure  to do any  act is made  or declared  to be unlawful  or  an offense  or  a misdemeanor,  the doing  of

9 such  prohibited  act or the failure  to do any such  required  act shall  constitute  a misdemeanor  and upon

10  conviction  thereof,  shall  be punished  by a fine  of  not  more  than  $1,000.00  or  by  imprisonment  for  a term  of

11 not  more  than  six  months,  or  by  any  combination  of  such  fine  and  imprisonment.  Any  day  of  any  violation

12  of  this  ordinance  shall  constitute  a separate  offense.

SECTION  7: All  ordinances  or parts  of  ordinances  or sections,  subsections,  phrases,

14  sentences,  clauses  or paragraphs  contained  in the Municipal  Code  of  the  City  of  Las  Vegas,  Nevada,  1983

15  Edition,  in conflict  herewith  are hereby  repealed.

20  ATTEST:

PASSED,  ADOPTED  and  APPROVED  this  )l- D day  of  J b

APPROVED:

Bgian Knudsen, Mayor  Pro-Tem

City  CIerk

ValSteed.  Date

Deputy  City  Attorney

-2-



The above  and foregoing  ordinance  was first  proposed  and read by title  to the City

Council  on the 2nd day of  July,  2025,  and referred  to a committee  for  recommendation;

hereafter  the committee  reported  favorably  on said ordinance  on the 15th day of  July,

2025,  which  as a regular  meeting  of  said Council;  that at said regular  meeting,  the

proposed  ordinance  was read  by title  to the City  Council  and adopted  by the following

vote:

VOTING  "AYE": Mayor  Pro  Tem  Knudsen,  and Councilmembers,  Seaman,

Diaz,  Allen-Palenske,  Brune  and  Sumn'iers-Armstrong

VOTING  "NAY": None

EXCUSED:

THOSE  NOT  VOTING:

Mayor  Berkley

None

APPRO

ATTEST:

-@<Q'T,'{'F3 '/,  Mayor  -

Brian  Knudsen,  Mayor  Pro-Tem

DR4 )lU,'-Ig  D. HOLMES, MMC City Clerk



LAS'VEGAS
REvw-30URNAL

Las Vegas  Review-Journal

1111 W. Bonanza  Road

Las Vegas,  NV  89106

AFFIDAVIT  OF PUBLICATION

ST  ATE  OF NEV  ADA)

COUNTY  OF  CLARK)  SS:

LV CITY  CLERK

ATTN:  ARLENE

495  S MAIN  ST

LAS  VEGAS  NV  89101

Account  #

Order  ID

104115

337798

Leslie  McCormick,  being  1st  duty  sworn,  deposes  and  says:  That  she  is the  Legal  Clerk

for  the  Las  Vegas  Review-Journal/Las  Vegas  Sun,  daily  newspaper  regularly  issued,

published  and  circulated  in the  Clark  County,  Las  Vegas,  Nevada  and  that  the

advertisement,  a true  copy  attached  for,  was  continuously  published  in said  Las  Vegas

Review-Journal/Las  Vegas  Sun,  in 1 edition(s)  of  said  newspaper  issued  from  07/03/2025

to 07/03/2025,  on the  following  day(s):

07/03/2025

7-m

LEGAL  ADVERTISEMENT  REPRESENTATIVE

Subscribed  and  sworn  to before  me on this  July  3, 2025

Btu  N0. 2025-22

AN ORDINANCE  TO ADOPT  THE
2024  EDlnON  OF THE  UNIFORM
MECHANICAL  CODE,  TOGETHER
WITH  AMENDMENTS  THERETO,
AND  TO PROVIDE  FOR OTHER
RELATED  MATTERS.

Pmposed  by:  Seth  T. Floyd,
Director  of  Community
Development

Summary:  Adopts  the  2024
Edition  of  the  'unifwm

:l',;:t,p  m4'Rter'=.'he'
At  the  City  Council  meeting  of

July2,2025

Btu  N0.  2025-22  WAS  READ  BY

nTLE  AND  REFERRED  TO  A

RECOMMENDING  COMMITTEE

COPIES  OF  THE  COMPLETE
ORDINANCE  ARE  AVAILABLE
FOR  PLIBLIC  INFORMA'nON  IN
THE  OFFICE  OF  THE  CITY  CLERK,

2ND FLOOR,  495 SOUTH  MAIN
STREET,  LASVE(15,  NEVADA

Notary

Llffl;)A ESPINOZA

Notary Public, S(ate of Nevada

MyAppointmeni No. 24-9178-01

Expires: July 14, 2028

PUB:  July  3, 2a25
LV Review-journal

Page  1 of 1



LASVEGAS
REVlk;W-jUURNALi

Las  Vcgas  Review-Joumal

1111 W. Bonanza  Road

Las  Vegas,  NV  89106

AFFIDAVIT  OF  PUBLICATION

ST  ATE  OF NEV  ADA)

COUNTY  OF  CLARK)  SS:

LV CITY  CLERK

AnN:  ARLENE

495  S MAIN  ST

LAS  VEGAS  NV  89101

Account  #

Order  ID

104115

338560

Leslie  McCormick,  being  1st  duty  sworn,  deposes  and  says:  That  she  is the  Legal  Clerk

for  the  Las  Vegas  Review-Journal/Las  Vegas  Sun,  daily  newspaper  regularly  issued,

published  and  circulated  in the  Clark  County,  Las  Vegas,  Nevada  and  that  the

advertisement,  a true  copy  attached  for,  was  continuously  published  in said  Las  Vegas

Review-Journal/Las  Vegas  Sun,  in 1 edition(s)  of  said  newspaper  issued  from  07/19/2025

to 07/19/2025,  on the  following  day(s):

07/19/2025

LEGAL  ADVERTISEMENT  REPRESENTATIVE

Subscribed  and  sworn  to before  me  on this  July  49, 2025

Notary 4,;,tA
LINI;)A ESPINOZA

Notary Public, State of Nevada

''M0%JxyqpEpxopylnretms:eJnu\yxol-:l:-Og2r;s-ot

Btu  N0. 2025-22

ORDINANCE N0. 6')15

AN ORDINANCE  TO ADOPT  THE
2€124 EOlnON  OF  THE  UNIFORM
MECHANICAL  CODE,  TOGETHER
WITH  AMENDMENTS  THERETO,
AND  TO  PROVIDE  FOR  OTHER
RELATED  MATTERS.

Pmposed  by:  Seth  T.  Floyd,
Director  of  Community
Development

Summary:  Adopts  the  X124
Edition  of  the  Uniform
Mechanical  Code, together
with  amendmentsthereto.

The above  and  foregoing
ordinance  was first  proposed
and rezid by title  to the City
Council on the  2nd day of  July,
2025, and  referred  to  a
committee  for
recommendation;  thsreafter
the  committee  reported
favorably  on said ordinance  on
the 16th  do  afJuly,  2025, which
was a regular  meeting  of said
City Council; and 'that at  said
meeting,  the  proposed
ordinance  was read by title  to
the  City  Council  as first
intmduced  and adopted  by  the
following  vote:

VOIING  "AYE"i  Mayor  Prg  Tem
Knudsen  and  Councilmembers
Seaman,  Diaz,  Allen-Palenske,
Brune  and  Summers-
Armstrong

EXCUSED:  Mayor  Berkley

COPIES  OF  THE  COMPLETE
ORDINANCE  ARE  AVAILABLE
FOR PLIBLIC  INFORMA'nON  IN
THE  OFFICE  OFTHECITf  CLERK,
2ND  ELOOR,  495 SOUTH  MAIN
STREET,  LAS  VEaAS,  NEVADA

PUB: July 19, 2€125
LV Review-Journal

Page  4 of 1



SOUTHERN  NEVADA  AMENDMENTS

TO THE

2024  UNIFORM  MECHANICAL  CODE

Version  Dated:  February  26, 2025



Preface

This  document  was  developed  by the  Southern  Nevada  Building  Officials'  (SNBO)  Plumbing  and

Mechanical  Code  Committee  and presents  amendments  to the  2024  Uniform  Mechanical  Code

(UMC)  as published  by the International  Association  of Plumbing  and Mechanical  Officials

(IAPMO).

Participation  in the  2024  Plumbing  and Mechanical  Code  Committee  was  open  to all interested

parties.  However,  voting  on amendments  proposals  was  limited  to one vote  each  for  seven

Southern  Nevada  municipalities  (Clark  County,  Henderson,  Las  Vegas,  North  Las  Vegas,  Boulder

City,  Pahrump,  and  Mesquite),  the  Clark  County  School  District,  and  three  industry

representatives.  All committee  proceedings  were  conducted  in accordance  with  Robert's  Rules

of Order.

The  recommended  amendments  contained  herein  are not  code  unless  adopted  and codified  by

governmental  jurisdictions.  These  amendments  are not intended  to prevent  the use of any

material  or  method  of construction  not  specifically  prescribed  herein,  provided  any  alternates  have

been  approved  and  their  use authorized  by the Building  Official.  This  document  may  be copied

and used  in whole  or in part  without  permission  or approval  from  the  organizations  listed  on the

COVer  pagei

Page  2 of 9 February  26, 2025



Table  of  Contents

Chapter  1 : Administration

Section  101.4

Section  203.0  -A-

Section  207.0  -E- ...

Section  304.3.1

Section  304.3.1.2

Section  504.4

Section  504.4.2.1

Section  508.4

Section  510.1.6.1

Section  510.3.3.3

Section  511.2.2.3

Section  603.12

Section  603.4.1

Section  609.1

Section  802.6.1

Section  932.1

Section  Chapter  10

Section  1119.1

Section  1301.0

Section  1310.1.6

4

4

.4

4

4

4

5

5

5

6

6

6

6

6

7

7

7

7

8

8

8

Page  3 of 9 February  26, 2025



Chapter  1 : Administration

Delete  Chapter  j in its entirety,  except  for  sections  101.  1, jOl.2  and  j01.3.

Section  101.4

Replace  Section  jOl.4  Appendices,  as follows.'

101.4  Appendices.  Only  Appendix  G and I are adopted.

Section  203.0  -A-

Revise  Air  Dispersion  Systems  definition,  as follows:

Air  Dispersion  Systems:  Any  diffuser  system  designed  to both  convey  air  within  a room,  space

or area  and diffuse  air into that  space  while  operating  under  positive  pressure.  Systems  are

commonly  constructed  of, but not limited  to, fabric  or plastic  fi!m.

Section  207.0  -E-

Replace  the  definition  for  Energy  Recovery  Ventilation  (ERV)  System,  as follows:

Systems  that  employ  air-to-air  heat  exchangers  to recover  energy  from  exhaust  air  for  the  purpose

of preheating,  precooling,  humidifying,  or dehumidifying  outdoor  ventilation  air  prior  to supplying

the  air  to a space,  either  directly  or as part  of an HVAC  system.

Section  304.3.1

Revise  Section  304.3.1  to read  as follows:

304.3.1.  Access.  Buildings  of more  than  15 feet  in height  shall  have  an interior  or exterior  means

of access  to the  roof  in accordance  with  sections  304.3.1.1  and  304.3.1.2  as applicable.

Section  304.3.1.2

Revise  Section  304.3.'7.2  Permanent  Ladders  to read  as follows:

Permanent  ladders  required  by Section  304.3.1.1  or exterior  ladders  shall  be constructed  in

accordance  with  the  following:

Page  4 of 9 February  26, 2025



(1 ) Side  railings  shall  extend  not  less  than  30 inches

(762  mm)  above  the  roof  or  parapet  wall.

(2) Landings  shall  not  exceed  18  feet  (5486  mm)  apart

measured  from  the  finished  grade.

(3) VVidth  shall  be not  less  than  14  inches  (356  mm)  on

center.

(4) Rungs  spacing  shall  not  exceed  12 inches  (305  mm)

on center,  and  each  rung  shall  be capable  of

supporting  a 300  pound  (136.  1 kg) load.

(5) Toe  space  shall  be not  less  than  6inches  (152  mm).

Exceptions:

4. Permanent  ladders  providing  roof  access  need  not  extend  closer  than  eight  (8)

feet  (2438  mm)  to the  finish  grade.

2. A portable  ladder  may  be used  for  access  for  a Group  R Division  3 and  4 and  U

occupancies.

3. Permanent  ladders  for  equipment  access  need  not  be provided  at parapets  or

walls  less  than  thirty  (30)  inches  (762mm)  in height.

Section  504.4

Revise  Subsection  504.4  by  adding  a new  exception,  as  follows:

Exception:  When  moisture  exhaust  ducts  terminate  vertically  through  a roof,  backdraft

dampers  are  not  required.

Section  504.4.2.1

Section  504.  4. 2. 1 is amended  by  the  addition  of  an exception  (2) to read  as  follows:

Exception  2: Lengths  may  be increased  when  justified  by calculations  prepared  by a

Nevada  Licensed  Mechanical  Engineer.

Section  508.4

Revise  UMC  2024  subsection  508.4,  as  follows:

508.4  Supports.  Hoods  shall  be secured  in place  to resist  lateral  loads  calculated  in accordance

with  ASCE  7-22  by noncombustible  supports.  The  structure,  anchors,  and  supports  shall  be

capable  of supporting  the  operating  weight  of the hood  assembly,  a 300-pound  (136.1  kg) live

load,  and  lateral  demands  of  the  hood  assembly.  Where  maintenance  access  has  been  provided

independently  of the hood,  the 300-pound  (136.1  kg) live load  need  not be applied.  Lateral

Page  5 of 9 February  26, 2025



demands  may  be resisted  by attaching  the  hood  assembly  to a non-combustible  wall  assembly

with  adequate  capacity  to resist  those  demands.

Section  510.1.6.1

Add  a new  Subsection  510.  1.6.1,  as  follows.'

510.1.6.I  Unless  specifically  listed,  the  structural  supports  for  a duct  enclosure  shall  be outside

the  enclosure.

Section  510.3.3.3

Revise  Subsection  5'70.3.3.3,  as  follows:

510.3.3.3  Support.  Support  systems  for  horizontal  grease  duct  systems  24 inches  (610  mm)  and

larger  in any  cross-sectional  dimension  shall  be  designed  for  the  operating  weight  of  the  ductwork

assembly,  a 300  pound  (136.1  kg) live load,  and lateral  demands  of the ductwork  assembly

calculated  in accordance  with  ASCE  7-22.  Where  maintenance  access  has been  provided

independently  of  the  hood,  the  300  pound  (136.  1 kg)  live  load  need  not  be applied.

Section  511.2.2.3

Add  a new  Subsection  511.2.2.3  Performance  Test  Report,  as  follows:

511.2.2.3  Performance  Test  Report.  The  permit  holder  shall  provide  the  jurisdiction  with  an

accurate,  completed,  and  signed  test  report.  The  report  shall  be on a form  supplied  by the

jurisdiction  or on a form  containing  equivalent  information.  At  the  discretion  of  the  building  official,

the  performance  test  may  be required  to be witnessed  by the  Authority  Having  Jurisdiction,

performed  by an approved  third  party  testing  agency.

Section  603.12

Revise  existing  Air  Dispersion  System  requirements,  as  follows:

603.12  Air  Dispersion  Systems.  Where  installed,  air  dispersion  systems  shall  be

completely  installed  in exposed  locations,  operate  under  positive

pressure,  and  not  pass  through  or penetrate  fire-resistant-rated  construction.  Air

dispersion  systems  shall  be listed  and  labeled  in accordance  with  UL  2518.

Section  603.4.1

Delete  Section  603.4.  1 Length  Limitation,  as  follows.'

603.4.1  Length  Limitation.  Factory-made  flexible  air  ducts  and  connectors  shall  be not more

than  5 feet  (1524  mm)  in length  and  shall  not  be used  in lieu  of  rigid  elbows  or  fittings.

Page  6 of 9 February  26, 2025



Exception:  Residential  occupancies.

Section  609.1

Revise  Section  609.  1 by  adding  a new  paragraph  following  the  exceptions,  as follows.'

Exception  6: Upon  completion  and before  final approval  of the air-moving  system

provided  with  the required  smoke  detectors,  a performance  test  shall  be performed  to

verify  compliance  of detector  installation  to manufacturer's  instructions  and system

compatibility  as specified  in this  chapter.  The  permit  holder  shall  furnish  the necessary

test  equipment  and  devices  required  to perform  the  tests  and  shall  provide  the  jurisdiction

with  an accurate,  completed,  and  signed  test  report.  The  report  shall  be on a form  supplied

by the  jurisdiction  or on a form  containing  equivalent  information.  At the  discretion  of  the

building  official,  the performance  test  may  be required  to be witnessed  by the  Authority

Having  Jurisdiction,  performed  by an approved  third  party  testing  agency.

Section  802.6.1

Add  an exception  to 802.6.1  ('7) to read  as follows:

Exception:  A single-family  residence  having  gas  vents  twelve  (12) inches  (300  mm)  in

size  or smaller  with  listed  caps  shall  be permitted  to be terminated  in accordance  with

Figure  802.6.1,  provided  they  are at least  four  (4) feet  (1.2  m) from  a vertical  wall  or  similar

obstruction.

Items  (2) through  (7) remain  unchanged.

Section  932.1

Add  sentence  to Section  932.1,  as follows:

932.1 General.  Evaporative  cooling  systems,  including  air ducts  and fire dampers  that  are a

portion  of an evaporative  cooling  systems,  shall  be in accordance  with  Section  932.2  through

Section  932.4.3.  Evaporative  cooling  systems  shall  be provided  with  outside  air  as specified  for

cooling  systems  in Section  403.0.  Evaporative  cooling  systems  shall  comply  with  the  applicable

water  service  rules  and  municipal  codes  by the  authority  having  jurisdiction.

Section  Chapter  10

Delete  Chapter  10  in its  entirety  except  Section  1001.  1 and  revise  Section  1001.  1, as follows:

l00l.f  Applicability.  For  boilers  and  water  heaters  less  than  120  gallon  capacity,  or a BTU  input

rating  less  than  200,000,  or less  than  160  pounds  per  square  inch  of pressure,  see  Chapter  5 of

Page  7 of 9 February  26, 2025



the Uniform  Plumbing  Code.  For  all other  units,  contact  the Mechanical  Section  of the Nevada

Division  of  Occupational  Safety  and  Health,  part  of  the  Office  of  Business  and  Industrial  Relations.

Keep  Exceptions  (1) through  (9).

Section  1119.'l

Add  sentence  to the end  of  section  1119.  1, as follows:

1119.1  Applicability.  Cooling  towers,  evaporative  condensers,  fluid  coolers,  and associated

remote  sump  tanks  shall  be readily  accessible.  Where  located  on roofs,  such  equipment  having

combustible  exterior  surfaces  shall  be protected  with  an approved  automatic  fire-extinguishing

system.  Evaporative  cooling  systems  shall  comply  with  the applicable  water  service  rules  and

municipal  codes  by the  authority  having  jurisdiction.

Section  1301.0

Revise  Section  1301  by  adding  a new  Subsection  l30j.2,  as follows.'

1301.2  Dry  Gas.  Southern  Nevada  shall  be considered  a dry  gas  condition  having  a moisture  and

hydrocarbon  dew  point  below  any  normal  temperature  to which  the  gas  piping  is in an exposed

area,  unless  specified  by the local  gas  purveyor.

Section  1310.1.6

Revise  Section  1310.  1.6, as follows.'

1310.1.6  Piping  Underground  Beneath  Buildings.  All gas  piping  under  a slab  shall  be capable

of being  removed  and replaced  without  disturbing  the slab. Where  gas piping  is installed

underground  beneath  any building,  structure  or appurtenance  including,  but not limited  to,

porches  and steps,  whether  covered  or uncovered,  breezeways,  roofed  porte-cocheres,  roofed

patios,  carports,  covered  walks,  and  covered  driveways,  the  piping  shall  be either  of  the  following:

(1) Encased  in an approved  conduit  that  shall  be not less  than  one-half  (1/2)  inch (15mm)

larger  than  the  outside  diameter  of  the  gas  piping,  not  less  than  Schedule  40 pipe,  designed

to withstand  the imposed  loads  and installed  in accordance  with  Section  1310.1.6.1  or

Section  1310.1.6.2.

(2) A piping/encasement  system  listed  for  installation  beneath  buildings.  [NFPA  54:7.1.6]

1310.1.6.1  Conduit  with  One  End  Terminating  Outdoors.  The  conduit  shall  extend  into  an

accessible  portion  of  the  building  and,  at the  point  where  the  conduit  terminates  in the  building,

the space  between  the conduit  and the gas piping  shall  be sealed  to prevent  the possible

entrance  of any  gas  leakage.  Where  the  end sealing  is of a type  that  retains  the  full pressure

of  the  pipe,  the  conduit  shall  be designed  for  the  same  pressure  as the  pipe.  The  conduit  shall

extend  at least  12 inches  (305  mm)  outside  the building,  be vented  outdoors  above  finished

Page  8 of 9 February  26, 2025



ground  level,  and be installed  so as to prevent  the entrance  of water  and insects.  [NFPA

54:7.1.6.1]

1310.1.6.2  Conduit  with  Both  Ends  Terminating  Indoors.  Where  the  conduit  originates  and

terminates  within  the  same  building,  the  conduit  shall  originate  and  terminate  in an accessible

portion  of the  building  and shall  not be sealed.  [NFPA  54:7.1.6.2]

Page  9 of 9 February  26, 2025


